From: ROBERT STEPHENSON rs41@comcast.net
Subject: Fwd: FW: Invoice #8485
Date: May 12, 2022 at 9:30 AM
To: rob@rs41.org

---------- Original Message ----------

From: Todd Croteau <tcroteau@townofjaffrey.com>
To: Robert Stephenson <rs41@comcast.net>

Date: 05/11/2022 11:44 AM

Subject: FW: Invoice #8485

Rob,

For your records.

Todd

Todd J. Croteau

Superintendent of Highways and Facilities
23 Knight Street

Jaffrey, NH 03452

603-532-6521

From: Stebbins Spectacular Painting LLC <messages@knowify.com>
Sent: Wednesday, May 11, 2022 9:59 AM

To: Todd Croteau <tcroteau @townofjaffrey.com>

Cc: Tim@stebbinspainting.com

Subject: Invoice #8485

Please find attached invoice #8485 for our services.
Thank you!
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